

02/15/2006
08:39:55

OKLAHOMA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
DELETIONS AND ADDITIONS TO PREVIOUSLY APPROVED BID OPENINGS
COMMISSION MEETING MARCH 6, 2006

PAGE: 1
JBPDC031

JOB PIECE	CD	HIGHWAY	MILES	ADV. FED	FEDERAL	STATE	OTHER	TOTAL

PROJECTS DELETED FROM JANUARY 2006 BID OPENING								
21211(04)	6	COBRGE	0.200	0	280,000	0	70,000	350,000
BEAVER		BRIDGE & APPROACHES BR & APPR ON COUNTY ROAD (EW-18) OVER HOME CREEK APPROX. 4.5 MI SOUTH & 1.6 MI. WEST OF BEAVER.(DEL FR 01-06, ADD TO 06-06;NO BIDS RECVD) "AUTH" BRF -104C (037) CO COMMISSION ACTION DATE:						

22325(04)	8	US060	0.200	0	0	100,000	0	100,000
CRAIG		BRIDGE REPAIR US-60: SUBSTRUCTURE REPAIR ON STRUCTURE OVER BNSF RR, .6 MI. W. OF SH-66 (DEL FR 01-06, ADD TO 04-06; NO BID RECVD) MC -118N (062) COMMISSION ACTION DATE:						

22383(04)	4	SH074	6.460	0	0	113,190	0	113,190
GARFIELD		ARMOR COAT SH-74 FROM SH-164 NORTH TO US-412 (ARMOR COAT)(DEL FR 01-06, ADD TO 04-06; NO BID RECVD) MC -124C (069) COMMISSION ACTION DATE:						

22384(04)	4	SH015	2.980	0	0	55,430	0	55,430
GARFIELD		ARMOR COAT SH-15 FROM US-412 NORTH 2.98 MI TO THE NORTH SIDE OF GARBER (ARMOR COAT)(DEL FR 01-06, ADD TO 04-06; NO BID RECVD) MC -124C (070) COMMISSION ACTION DATE:						

22379(04)	4	SH132	3.500	0	0	76,970	0	76,970
GRANT		ARMOR COAT ON SH-132 BEG. 7.35 MILE NORTH OF JCT SH-132/US-64(NASH), EXT NORTH 3.5 MI TO JCT SH-132/SH-11. (ARMOR COAT)(DEL FR 01-06, ADD TO 04-06; BID REJECT) MC -127C (076) COMMISSION ACTION DATE:						

22380(04)	4	SH132	5.090	0	0	97,100	0	97,100
GRANT		ARMOR COAT ON SH-132 BEG. @ GRANT/GARFIELD C/L EXTENDING NORTH 5.09 MILE TO JCT SH-132/US-64. (ARMOR COAT)(DEL FR 01-06, ADD TO 04-06; BID REJECT) (H-38) MC -127C (077) COMMISSION ACTION DATE:						

22442(04)	4	US060	5.150	0	0	576,250	0	576,250
KAY		RESURFACE US-60 BEG SH-156 EXT E 1.81 MI; US-60B BEG US-60 EXT E 1.54 MI; US-177 BEG 1.92 MI FR JCT US-60 EXT N 1.8 MI(DEL FR 01-06, ADD TO 04-06; NO BIDS) MC -136N (107) COMMISSION ACTION DATE:						

22729(04)	4	US060	0.020	0	0	842,816	0	842,816
KAY		BRIDGE REDECKING & REHAB US-60: REDECK & REHAB STRUCTURES OVER A.T. & S.F. R.R (DEL FR 01-06, ADD TO 04-06; NO BIDS RECVD) SBR -136A (112) SB COMMISSION ACTION DATE: 08/2005						

22381(04)	4	SH074E	4.980	0	0	75,320	0	75,320
LOGAN		ARMOR COAT ON SH-74E BEG. @ JCT SH-74E/SH-51, EXTEND NORTH 4.98 MILE TO JCT SH-74E/SH-74. (ARMOR COAT)(DEL FR 01-06, ADD TO 04-06; BID REJECT) MC -142C (113) COMMISSION ACTION DATE:						

02/15/2006
08:39:55

OKLAHOMA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
DELETIONS AND ADDITIONS TO PREVIOUSLY APPROVED BID OPENINGS
COMMISSION MEETING MARCH 6, 2006

PAGE: 2
JBPDC031

JOB PIECE	CD	HIGHWAY	MILES	ADV. FED	FEDERAL	STATE	OTHER	TOTAL
22382(04)	4	SH074F	8.000	0	0	131,020	0	131,020
LOGAN		ARMOR COAT ON SH-74F BEG. @ JCT OF SH-74F/SH-33 & EXTEND SOUTH 8.00 MILE TO JCT OF SH-74F/SH-74. (ARMOR COAT)(DEL FR 01-06, ADD TO 04-06; BID REJECT) MC -142C (114)						
COMMISSION ACTION DATE:								
22719(04)	1	US266	0.020	0	0	305,072	0	305,072
MCINTOSH		BRIDGE REDECKING & REHAB US-266: OVER GRAVES CREEK, 2.4 MI. E. OF OKMULGEE C/L (DEL FR 01-06, ADD TO 04-06; NO BID RECV'D) SBR -146C (079) SB						
COMMISSION ACTION DATE:						08/2005		
22740(04)	7	IS035	0.020	0	0	553,420	0	553,420
MURRAY		BRIDGE REDECKING & REHAB US-77: REDECK AND REHAB STRUCTURE OVER I-35 (DEL FR 01-06, ADD TO 04-06; NO BIDS RECV'D) SBR -150N (063) SB						
COMMISSION ACTION DATE:						08/2005		
22743(04)	8	SH020	0.020	0	0	663,310	0	663,310
ROGERS		BRIDGE REDECKING & REHAB SH-20: REDECK AND REHAB STRUCTURE OVER VERDIGRIS RIVER (DEL FR 01-06, ADD TO 04-06; NO BIDS RECV'D) SBR -166B (171) SB						
COMMISSION ACTION DATE:						08/2005		
22839(04)	8	IS044	1.100	0	0	250,937	0	250,937
TULSA		PATCHING & LEVELING COURSE I-44: BEG. CREEK/TULSA CO. LINE, EXT. E. 1.1 MI. (DEL FR 01-06, ADD TO 03-06; BID REJECT, LATE ADD) IMC -172N (299)						
COMMISSION ACTION DATE:								
PROJECTS DELETED FROM FEBRUARY 2006 BID OPENING								
14969(19)	5	SH006	6.200	0	5,750,000	0	0	5,750,000
BECKHAM		SURFACE SH-6 FR SH 55E EXT N. 6.2 MILES. (APPROX 4.7 MILES ON NEW ALIGNMENT)(SURF FOR 14969(08)(DEL FR 02-06, WITHDRAWN 2-7-06; FUNDING) STPY -105B (010)						
COMMISSION ACTION DATE:						12/1994		
22838(04)	8	SH125	0.430	0	0	164,155	0	164,155
DELAWARE		GUARDRAIL SH-125: BEGIN .72 MI. N. OF SH-85A JCT. AND EXT. N. .43 MI. (DEL FR 02-06, ADD TO UNSCHED. POOL; PRIORITY CHANGE) MC -121C (089)						
COMMISSION ACTION DATE:								
17426(04)	2	CO RD	5.000	0	2,502,073	0	375,268	2,877,341
MCCURTAIN		GRADE, DRAIN & SURFACE CO RD: BATTIEST-PICKENS ROAD BETWEEN BATTIEST AND PICKENS (DEL FR 02-06, ADD TO ??-??; FUNDING ISSUES) (H-19) **AUTH** HPP -0646 (007) HP						
COMMISSION ACTION DATE:						12/1998		
PROJECTS DELETED FROM MARCH 2006 BID OPENING								
20265(04)*	3	US270	0.030	0	3,322,800	0	0	3,322,800
HUGHES		BRIDGE & APPROACHES US-270: OVER SALT CREEK, 2.2 MILES EAST OF JCT US-75 (DEL FR 03-06, ADD TO 06-06; ROW & UT ISSUES) SMC 80/20 BRFY -132B (057)						
COMMISSION ACTION DATE:						10/2002		

02/15/2006
08:39:55

OKLAHOMA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
DELETIONS AND ADDITIONS TO PREVIOUSLY APPROVED BID OPENINGS
COMMISSION MEETING MARCH 6, 2006

PAGE: 3
JBPDC031

JOB PIECE	CD	HIGHWAY	MILES	ADV. FED	FEDERAL	STATE	OTHER	TOTAL
20248(04)	4	SH011	0.010	0	1,639,050	0	0	1,639,050
KAY		BRIDGE & APPROACHES SH-11 OVER TURKEY CREEK, 1.1 MILE EAST OF JCT US-77 (DEL FR 03-06, ADD TO 04-06; ROW & UT ISSUES) SMC 80/20 BRFY -136C (067) COMMISSION ACTION DATE: 10/2002						
20880(04)*	3	IS040	0.020	0	20,516,296	0	0	20,516,296
POTTAWATOMIE		BRIDGE & APPROACHES I-40 UNDER SH-102, SH-102 INTERCHANGE AND I-40 AT DEER CREEK 5.0 MI EAST OF OKLAHOMA C/L(DEL FR 03-06, ADD TO 08-06; ROW & UT ISSUES) BRIY -0040-5(383) 178 COMMISSION ACTION DATE: 08/2003						
09482(04)*	8	SH020	4.000	0	14,142,278	0	0	14,142,278
TULSA		GRADE, DRAIN & SURFACE SH-20 FROM US-169 IN TULSA CO. EAST 4.0 MILES TO EAST OF 209TH E AVE. (UNAWARDED 12/5/02, TO BE RE-LET 06-06; UTILITY ISSUES)SMC80/20 **AUTH** STPY -072B (421) COMMISSION ACTION DATE: 01/1988						
17022(04)	8	CT ST	2.000	0	750,000	0	250,000	1,000,000
TULSA		GRADE, DRAIN & SURFACE GLENPOOL: ELWOOD AVENUE FROM 151ST TO 131ST (DEL FR 03-06, ADD TO 04-06; AS PER LOCAL GOVERNMENT) **AUTH** STP -172B (034) UR COMMISSION ACTION DATE:						
PROJECTS ADDED TO MARCH 2006 BID OPENING								
21569(04)	4	COBRGE	0.200	0	103,218	0	186,782	290,000
CANADIAN		BRIDGE & APPROACHES CO. BR.: BRIDGE AND APPROACHES OVER A TRIB TO N. CANADIAN R., 2.5 MI. N. & 1.6 MI. E. OF GEARY; (DEL FR 02-06, ADD TO 03-06; NOT ADVERTISED) "AUTH" BRO -109D (092) CO COMMISSION ACTION DATE:						
22647(04)	4	US064	6.700	0	1,711,396	0	0	1,711,396
GARFIELD		RESURFACE US-412/US-64: BEGIN 6.2 MI. E. OF US-64 JCT., IN ENID, AND EXT. E 6.7 MI. (EASTBOUND LANES ONLY)(DEL FR 02-06, ADD TO 03-06; NOT ADVERTISED) **AUTH** NHY -019N (097) 3R COMMISSION ACTION DATE:						
22648(04)	4	US064	1.480	0	385,856	0	0	385,856
GARFIELD		RESURFACE US-412/US-64: BEGIN 12.9 MI. E. OF US-64 JCT., IN ENID, AND EXT. E 1.48 MI. (EASTBOUND LANES ONLY)(DEL FR 02-06, ADD TO 03-06; NOT ADVERTISED) **AUTH** NHY -019N (098) 3R COMMISSION ACTION DATE:						
23031(04)	3	MAINT	5.000	0	0	308,900	0	308,900
GARVIN		RESURFACE I-35: VARIOUS LOCS. NB AND SB ALONG I-35, FROM MM 69 TO MM 74 (ADD TO 03-06; LATE ADD; FORMERLY IMX PROJ) IMC -125N (132) COMMISSION ACTION DATE:						
21335(04)	7	COBRGE	0.240	0	204,000	0	51,000	255,000
JEFFERSON		BRIDGE & APPROACHES COUNTY ROAD(NS-282) OVER MONUMENT CR. APPROX. 5.2 MI NORTH & 1.0 MI. EAST OF JCT US-81/US-70. (DEL FR 02-06, ADD TO 03-06; NOT ADVERTISED) **AUTH** BRO -134D (046) CO COMMISSION ACTION DATE:						

02/15/2006
08:39:55

OKLAHOMA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
DELETIONS AND ADDITIONS TO PREVIOUSLY APPROVED BID OPENINGS
COMMISSION MEETING MARCH 6, 2006

PAGE: 4
JBPDC031

JOB PIECE	CD	HIGHWAY	MILES	ADV. FED	FEDERAL	STATE	OTHER	TOTAL
21349(04)	7	COBRGE	0.400	0	291,200	0	71,800	363,000
BRIDGE & APPROACHES								
JEFFERSON	CO RD (NS281) OVER A TRIB TO BEAVER CR APPROX 3.0 MI NORTH & 1.2 MI WEST OF							
(DEL FR 02-05, ADD TO 03-06; NOT ADVERTISED) **AUTH**								
BRO -134D (047) CO COMMISSION ACTION DATE:								
19434(04)	8	SH010	0.120	0	59,535	0	0	59,535
BRIDGE PAINTING								
OTTAWA	SH-10: OVER SPRING RIVER, 3.7 MILES WEST OF JCT SH-10C							
(DEL FR 02-06, ADD TO 03-06; NOT ADVERTISED) **AUTH**								
BRFY -NBIP (215) COMMISSION ACTION DATE: 03/2002								
18866(04)	3	CT ST	0.503	0	1,373,250	0	0	1,373,250
GRADE, DRAIN & SURFACE								
POTTAWATOMIE	CITY STREET: MACARTHUR STREET FROM AIRPORT DRIVE EAST TO							
KICKAPOO STREET(DEL FR 02-06, ADD TO 03-06; NOT ADVERTISED) **AUTH**								
STPY -163C (079) UR COMMISSION ACTION DATE: 11/2000								
18969(04)	3		0.430	0	1,200,000	0	0	1,200,000
GRADE, DRAIN & SURFACE								
POTTAWATOMIE	SH-3E: SH-3E & KICKAPOO ST FROM I-40 TO 45TH ST IN SHAWNEE							
(DEL FR 02-06, ADD TO 03-06; NOT ADVERTISED) **AUTH**								
SEC115 -0H17 (004) SG COMMISSION ACTION DATE: 11/2000								
31 PROJECTS	GRAND-TOTALS			0	54,230,952	4,313,890	1,004,850	59,549,692

02/15/2006
09:07:24

OKLAHOMA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
FINAL APRIL 2006 BID OPENING

PAGE: 1
JBPDC025
TOTAL

JOB PIECE	CD	HIGHWAY	MILES	ADV. FED	FEDERAL	STATE	OTHER	TOTAL
16631(04)*	1	US059	0.100	0	4,090,200	0	0	4,090,200
ADAIR		BRIDGE & APPROACHES US 59 BRIDGE OVER THE ILLINOIS RIVER NORTH OF WATTS. (RDY=16710(04)) (DEL FR 02-06, ADD TO 04-06; ENVIRON. ISSUES) SMC80/20 BRFY -101A (010) COMMISSION ACTION DATE: 05/1997						
16710(04)*	1	US059	2.000	0	7,025,000	0	0	7,025,000
ADAIR		GRADE, DRAIN & SURFACE US-59 FROM WATTS NORTH 2.0 MILES (4 LANES) (BR=16631(04)) (DEL FR 02-06, ADD TO 04-06; ENVIRON. ISSUES) STPY -101A (012) COMMISSION ACTION DATE: 07/1997						
22832(04)	2	US069	16.760	0	370,000	0	0	370,000
ATOKA		GUARDRAIL US-69/US-75: INSTALL GUARDRAIL, BEGIN AT BRYAN C/L, AND EXT. N. 16.76 MI. TO JCT. OF SH-3 NHG -013N (102) TR COMMISSION ACTION DATE: 10/2005						
22833(04)	2	US069	24.720	0	280,000	0	0	280,000
ATOKA		GUARDRAIL US-69: INSTALL GUARDRAIL, BEGIN SH-3 JCT AND EXT. N. 24.72 MI. TO PITTSBURG C/L NHG -013N (103) TR COMMISSION ACTION DATE: 10/2005						
21505(04)	7	COBRGE	0.000	0	96,000	0	24,000	120,000
CARTER		BRIDGE REPAIR CO. BR.: REHAB TO 2 BRIDGE BOXES OVER UNNAMED CREEKS, APPROX 4.5 MI. W. THEN 3.2 MI. & 4.6 MI N. OF US-70/I-35 JCT. BRF -110C (131) CO COMMISSION ACTION DATE:						
15392(07)	3	IS035	0.350	0	49,300	0	530,700	580,000
CLEVELAND		BRIDGE & APPROACHES I-35 UNDER SOUTH 19TH STREET IN MOORE (FED FUNDS FOR CONSTRUCTION ENGINEERING ONLY) IMY -0035-2(292) 116 COMMISSION ACTION DATE: 08/1995						
21535(04)	3	CT ST	1.000	0	95,480	0	0	95,480
CLEVELAND		TRAFFIC SIGNALS MOORE: TRAFFIC SIGNALS AT INTERSECTION OF SW4TH & WILSON/MARKWELL (DEL FR 01-06, ADD TO 04-06; PLANS) **AUTH** STPG -114B (133) AG COMMISSION ACTION DATE:						
21502(04)	3	COBRGE	0.220	0	148,000	0	37,000	185,000
COAL		BRIDGE & APPROACHES CO. BR.: BRIDGE AND APPROACHES OVER ARM OF COALGATE RESERVOIR, 1.0 MI. N. OF COAL & 0.9 MI. E. OF US-75 ON EW-168 BRO -115D (034) CO COMMISSION ACTION DATE:						
22325(04)	8	US060	0.200	0	0	100,000	0	100,000
CRAIG		BRIDGE REPAIR US-60: SUBSTRUCTURE REPAIR ON STRUCTURE OVER BNSF RR, .6 MI. W. OF SH-66 (DEL FR 01-06, ADD TO 04-06; NO BID RECVD) MC -118N (062) COMMISSION ACTION DATE:						

02/15/2006
09:07:24

OKLAHOMA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
FINAL APRIL 2006 BID OPENING

PAGE: 2
JBPDC025

JOB PIECE	CD	HIGHWAY	MILES	ADV. FED	FEDERAL	STATE	OTHER	TOTAL
22975(04)	5		0.000	0	90,000	0	0	90,000
CUSTER BRIDGE WATER PROOF SEAL 2006 SILANE PROJECTS, DIVISION 5 (DIVISION-WIDE) BRFY -120C (113) COMMISSION ACTION DATE:								
22383(04)	4	SH074	6.460	0	0	113,190	0	113,190
GARFIELD ARMOR COAT SH-74 FROM SH-164 NORTH TO US-412 (ARMOR COAT)(DEL FR 01-06, ADD TO 04-06; NO BID RECV'D) MC -124C (069) COMMISSION ACTION DATE:								
22384(04)	4	SH015	2.980	0	0	55,430	0	55,430
GARFIELD ARMOR COAT SH-15 FROM US-412 NORTH 2.98 MI TO THE NORTH SIDE OF GARBER (ARMOR COAT)(DEL FR 01-06, ADD TO 04-06; NO BID RECV'D) MC -124C (070) COMMISSION ACTION DATE:								
17981(04)	3	IS035	0.048	0	179,099	0	0	179,099
GARVIN BRIDGE PAINTING I-35: OVER SH-19, 17 MI. N. OF MURRAY C/L PARALLEL BRIDGES SMC 90/10 IMY -NBIP-0(145) 000 COMMISSION ACTION DATE: 07/1999								
17981(05)	3	IS035	0.048	0	54,446	0	0	54,446
GARVIN JOINT SEAL/REPAIR I-35: OVER SH-19, 17 MI. N. OF MURRAY C/L PARALLEL BRIDGES SMC 90/10 IMY -0035-2(256) 072 COMMISSION ACTION DATE: 07/1999								
17982(04)	3	IS035	0.030	0	74,027	0	0	74,027
GARVIN BRIDGE PAINTING I-35: OVER SHORT CREEK, 8.6 MI. N. OF JCT. SH-19 PARALLEL BRIDGES SMC 80/20 BHIY -NBIP-0(147) 000 COMMISSION ACTION DATE: 07/1999								
17982(05)	3	IS035	0.030	0	72,595	0	0	72,595
GARVIN JOINT SEAL/REPAIR I-35: OVER SHORT CREEK, 8.6 MI. N. OF JCT. SH-19 PARALLEL BRIDGES SMC 80/20 IMY -0035-2(254) 081 COMMISSION ACTION DATE: 07/1999								
18000(04)	3	IS035	0.060	0	41,322	0	0	41,322
GARVIN BRIDGE PAINTING I-35: COUNTY ROAD OVER I-35, 4.8 MI. N. OF MURRAY C/L IMY -NBIP-0(198) 000 COMMISSION ACTION DATE: 07/1999								
18000(05)	3	IS035	0.060	0	59,032	0	0	59,032
GARVIN JOINT SEAL/REPAIR I-35: COUNTY ROAD OVER I-35, 4.8 MI. N. OF MURRAY C/L IMY -0035-2(261) 067 COMMISSION ACTION DATE: 07/1999								
20749(04)	3	COBRGE	0.257	0	182,400	0	45,600	228,000
GARVIN BRIDGE & APPROACHES COUNTY BRIDGE OVER WASHINGTON CREEK, 4.0 MILES NORTH AND 0.6 MILES EAST OF PAULS VALLEY BRO -125D (104) CO COMMISSION ACTION DATE:								

02/15/2006
09:07:24

OKLAHOMA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
FINAL APRIL 2006 BID OPENING

PAGE: 3
JBPDC025

JOB PIECE	CD	HIGHWAY	MILES	ADV. FED	FEDERAL	STATE	OTHER	TOTAL
22093(04)	7	COBRGE	0.200	0	192,000	0	48,000	240,000
GRADY		BRIDGE & APPROACHES					(A)	
		CO BR ON COUNTY ROAD (EW 123) OVER AN UNNAMED CREEK APPROX. 8.5 MI WEST & 7.0 MI SOUTH OF THE SH-37/US-81 JCT. IN MINCO						
		BRO -126D (101) CO						
								COMMISSION ACTION DATE:
22379(04)	4	SH132	3.500	0	0	76,970	0	76,970
GRANT		ARMOR COAT						
		ON SH-132 BEG. 7.35 MILE NORTH OF JCT SH-132/US-64(NASH), EXT NORTH 3.5 MI TO JCT SH-132/SH-11. (ARMOR COAT)(DEL FR 01-06, ADD TO 04-06; BID REJECT)						
		MC -127C (076)						
								COMMISSION ACTION DATE:
22380(04)	4	SH132	5.090	0	0	97,100	0	97,100
GRANT		ARMOR COAT						
		ON SH-132 BEG. @ GRANT/GARFIELD C/L EXTENDING NORTH 5.09 MILE TO JCT SH-132/US-64. (ARMOR COAT)(DEL FR 01-06, ADD TO 04-06; BID REJECT) (H-38)						
		MC -127C (077)						
								COMMISSION ACTION DATE:
22976(04)	6		0.000	0	43,000	0	0	43,000
HARPER		BRIDGE WATER PROOF SEAL						
		2006 SILANE PROJECTS, DIVISION 6 (DIVISION-WIDE)						
		BRFY -130C (098)						
								COMMISSION ACTION DATE:
20773(04)	3	COBRGE	0.257	0	208,000	0	52,000	260,000
HUGHES		BRIDGE & APPROACHES					(A)	
		COUNTY BRIDGE OVER TRIB OF GOBBLER CREEK, 0.8 MILES SOUTH AND 0.5 MILES EAST OF LAMAR (DEL FR 03-05, ADD TO 04-06; ROW ISSUES)						
		BRO -132D (064) CO						
								COMMISSION ACTION DATE:
20248(04)	4	SH011	0.010	0	1,639,050	0	0	1,639,050
KAY		BRIDGE & APPROACHES						
		SH-11 OVER TURKEY CREEK, 1.1 MILE EAST OF JCT US-77 (DEL FR 03-06, ADD TO 04-06; ROW & UT ISSUES) SMC 80/20						
		BRFY -136C (067)						
								COMMISSION ACTION DATE: 10/2002
22442(04)	4	US060	5.150	0	0	576,250	0	576,250
KAY		RESURFACE						
		US-60 BEG SH-156 EXT E 1.81 MI; US-60B BEG US-60 EXT E 1.54 MI; US-177 BEG 1.92 MI FR JCT US-60 EXT N 1.8 MI(DEL FR 01-06, ADD TO 04-06; NO BIDS)						
		MC -136N (107)						
								COMMISSION ACTION DATE:
22729(04)	4	US060	0.020	0	0	842,816	0	842,816
KAY		BRIDGE REDECKING & REHAB						
		US-60: REDECK & REHAB STRUCTURES OVER A.T. & S.F. R.R (DEL FR 01-06, ADD TO 04-06; NO BIDS RECV'D)						
		SBR -136A (112) SB						
								COMMISSION ACTION DATE: 08/2005
20731(04)	3	COBRGE	0.272	0	288,000	0	70,800	358,800
LINCOLN		BRIDGE & APPROACHES					(A)	
		COUNTY BRIDGE OVER WILDHORSE CREEK, 1.0 MILES NORTH AND 3.4 MILES WEST OF ELBA						
		BRF -141C (118) CO						
								COMMISSION ACTION DATE:
22381(04)	4	SH074E	4.980	0	0	75,320	0	75,320
LOGAN		ARMOR COAT						
		ON SH-74E BEG. @ JCT SH-74E/SH-51, EXTEND NORTH 4.98 MILE TO JCT SH-74E/SH-74. (ARMOR COAT)(DEL FR 01-06, ADD TO 04-06; BID REJECT)						
		MC -142C (113)						
								COMMISSION ACTION DATE:

02/15/2006
09:07:24

OKLAHOMA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
FINAL APRIL 2006 BID OPENING

PAGE: 4
JBPDC025

JOB PIECE	CD	HIGHWAY	MILES	ADV. FED	FEDERAL	STATE	OTHER	TOTAL
22382(04)	4	SH074F	8.000	0	0	131,020	0	131,020
LOGAN		ARMOR COAT ON SH-74F BEG. @ JCT OF SH-74F/SH-33 & EXTEND SOUTH 8.00 MILE TO JCT OF SH-74F/SH-74. (ARMOR COAT)(DEL FR 01-06, ADD TO 04-06; BID REJECT) MC -142C (114)						
							COMMISSION ACTION DATE:	
21354(04)	7	COBRGE	0.000	0	204,000	0	51,000	255,000
LOVE		BRIDGE & APPROACHES CO BR REPAIR & REHABILITATION @ 4 SITES IN LOVE COUNTY BHF -143C (064) CO					(A)	
							COMMISSION ACTION DATE:	
19482(04)	3	US077	0.080	0	159,358	0	0	159,358
MCCLAIN		BRIDGE PAINTING US-77: OVER WALNUT CREEK, AT NORTH SIDE OF JCT SH-39 BRFY -NBIP (263)					(S-16)(H-42) SMC=80/20	
							COMMISSION ACTION DATE: 03/2002	
19482(05)	3	US077	0.080	0	106,600	0	0	106,600
MCCLAIN		JOINT SEAL/REPAIR US-77: OVER WALNUT CREEK, AT NORTH SIDE OF JCT SH-39 BRFY -144C (044)					(S-16)(H-42)SMC=80/20	
							COMMISSION ACTION DATE: 03/2002	
22719(04)	1	US266	0.020	0	0	305,072	0	305,072
MCINTOSH		BRIDGE REDECKING & REHAB US-266: OVER GRAVES CREEK, 2.4 MI. E. OF OKMULGEE C/L (DEL FR 01-06, ADD TO 04-06; NO BID RECVD) SBR -146C (079) SB						
							COMMISSION ACTION DATE: 08/2005	
22356(04)	8	US069	0.020	0	100,000	0	0	100,000
MAYES		TRAFFIC SIGNALS INSTALL TRAFFIC SIGNAL AT INTERS. OF US-69 & HARRISON ST., IN CHOUTEAU NHY -013N (095) TR						
							COMMISSION ACTION DATE: 04/2005	
22740(04)	7	IS035	0.020	0	0	553,420	0	553,420
MURRAY		BRIDGE REDECKING & REHAB US-77: REDECK AND REHAB STRUCTURE OVER I-35 (DEL FR 01-06, ADD TO 04-06; NO BIDS RECVD) SBR -150N (063) SB						
							COMMISSION ACTION DATE: 08/2005	
22971(04)	1		0.000	0	37,000	0	0	37,000
MUSKOGEE		BRIDGE WATER PROOF SEAL 2006 SILANE PROJECTS, DIVISION 1 (DIVISION-WIDE) BRFY -151C (153)						
							COMMISSION ACTION DATE:	
22974(04)	4		0.000	0	130,000	0	0	130,000
NOBLE		BRIDGE WATER PROOF SEAL 2006 SILANE PROJECTS, DIVISION 4 (DIVISION-WIDE) BRFY -152C (099)						
							COMMISSION ACTION DATE:	
19477(04)	3	SH056	0.050	0	54,902	0	0	54,902
OKFUSKEE		BRIDGE PAINTING SH-56: OVER NUYAKA CREEK, 15.8 MILES NORTHEAST OF JCT US-62 (DEL FR 05-06, ADD TO 04-06; BID REJECT) BRFY -NBIP (258)					SMC 80/20 **AUTH**	
							COMMISSION ACTION DATE: 03/2002	

02/15/2006
09:07:24

OKLAHOMA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
FINAL APRIL 2006 BID OPENING

PAGE: 5
JBPDC025

JOB PIECE	CD	HIGHWAY	MILES	ADV. FED	FEDERAL	STATE	OTHER	TOTAL
22362(04)	8	CO RD	5.500	0	0	0	252,000	252,000
OTTAWA		RESURFACE RESURFACE NS 461 FROM SH 10 NORTH 5.5 MILES TO US 69 CR -158C (087) CO					(A)	
COMMISSION ACTION DATE:								
18921(04)	4	SH051	0.000	0	633,400	0	0	633,400
PAYNE		INTERSECTION MOD. & TRAF. SIGNALS SH-51 AT JUNCTION OF JARDOT ROAD IN STILLWATER STPY -160A (074) TR						
COMMISSION ACTION DATE: 02/2001								
20150(04)	2	COBRGE	0.200	0	150,000	0	100,000	250,000
PITTSBURG		BRIDGE & APPROACHES COUNTY BRIDGE & APPROACHES OVER UNNAMED CREEK, 1.5 MILES WEST OF CROWDER ON NS 411 BRO -161D (112) CO					(A)	
COMMISSION ACTION DATE:								
18008(04)	3	SH001	0.040	0	130,150	0	0	130,150
PONTOTOC		BRIDGE PAINTING SH-1: OVER SH-19, 1 MI. W. OF ADA (PARALLEL BRIDGES) (DEL FR 05-05, ADD TO 04-06; BID REJECT) BHFY -NBIP (175)			SMC 80/20	**AUTH**		
COMMISSION ACTION DATE: 07/1999								
22973(04)	3		0.000	0	90,000	0	0	90,000
PONTOTOC		BRIDGE WATER PROOF SEAL 2006 SILANE PROJECTS, DIVISION 3 (DIVISION-WIDE) BRFY -162C (145)						
COMMISSION ACTION DATE:								
17999(04)	3	IS040	0.026	0	61,492	0	0	61,492
POTTAWATOMIE		BRIDGE PAINTING I-40: OVER AT & SF RAILROAD, 12.9 MI. E. OF OKLAHOMA C/L PARALLEL BRIDGES IMY -NBIP-0(196) 000			(S-28)	SMC 90/10		
COMMISSION ACTION DATE: 07/1999								
17999(05)	3	IS040	0.026	0	49,193	0	0	49,193
POTTAWATOMIE		JOINT SEAL/REPAIR I-40: OVER AT & SF RAILROAD, 12.9 MI. E. OF OKLAHOMA C/L PARALLEL BRIDGES IMY -0040-5(357) 186			(S-28)	SMC 90/10		
COMMISSION ACTION DATE: 07/1999								
22972(04)	2		0.000	0	30,000	0	0	30,000
PUSHMATAHA		BRIDGE WATER PROOF SEAL 2006 SILANE PROJECTS, DIVISION 2 (DIVISION-WIDE) BRFY -164C (087)						
COMMISSION ACTION DATE:								
22743(04)	8	SH020	0.020	0	0	663,310	0	663,310
ROGERS		BRIDGE REDECKING & REHAB SH-20: REDECK AND REHAB STRUCTURE OVER VERDIGRIS RIVER (DEL FR 01-06, ADD TO 04-06; NO BIDS RECV'D) SBR -166B (171) SB						
COMMISSION ACTION DATE: 08/2005								
10166(08)*	3	SH099	4.500	0	11,213,458	0	0	11,213,458
SEMINOLE		GRADE, DRAIN & SURFACE SH-99 FROM 0.5 MILE SOUTH OF I-40 SOUTH 4.5 MILES (4-LANE) (DEL FR 01-06, ADD TO 04-06; PRIORITY CHANGE) CORR RTE NHY -012N (014)						
COMMISSION ACTION DATE: 01/1988								

02/15/2006
09:07:24

OKLAHOMA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
FINAL APRIL 2006 BID OPENING

PAGE: 6
JBPDC025

JOB PIECE	CD	HIGHWAY	MILES	ADV. FED	FEDERAL	STATE	OTHER	TOTAL
10166(09)	3	SH099	0.100	0	1,139,250	0	0	1,139,250
SEMINOLE		BRIDGE & APPROACHES SH 99 BRIDGE APPROXIMATELY 1.0 MILE SOUTH OF I-40 (PARALLEL LANES)(WITHIN 10166(08)(DEL FR 01-06, ADD TO 04-06; PRIORITY CHG) NHY -012N (015) COMMISSION ACTION DATE: 01/1988						
19474(04)	3	US270	0.030	0	54,902	0	0	54,902
SEMINOLE		BRIDGE PAINTING US-270: CRI & P UNDER, 6.6 MILES SOUTHEAST OF JCT SH-3 (DEL FR 05-05, ADD TO 04-06; BID REJECT) SMC 80/20 **AUTH** STPY -NBIP (255) COMMISSION ACTION DATE: 03/2002						
23038(04)	1	PK RD	1.000	0	0	50,000	0	50,000
SEQUOYAH		RESURFACE PARK ROAD: PAVING OF GRAVEL LOOP, ACCESSING RV SITES, MAINT./PARK OFFICE DRIVEWAY, AND PARK RESIDENCE DRIVEWAY SAP -168D (149) COMMISSION ACTION DATE:						
23039(04)	1	PK RD	1.000	0	0	50,000	0	50,000
SEQUOYAH		RESURFACE PARK ROAD: PAVING OF PARKING LOTS AND ROADS AROUND, SHELTERS AND BATHHOUSES AT VARIOUS LOCATIONS SAP -168D (150) COMMISSION ACTION DATE:						
22977(04)	7		0.000	0	30,000	0	0	30,000
STEPHENS		BRIDGE WATER PROOF SEAL 2006 SILANE PROJECTS, DIVISION 7 (DIVISION-WIDE) BRFY -169C (116) COMMISSION ACTION DATE:						
17022(04)	8	CT ST	2.000	0	750,000	0	250,000	1,000,000
TULSA		GRADE, DRAIN & SURFACE GLENPOOL: ELWOOD AVENUE FROM 151ST TO 131ST (DEL FR 03-06, ADD TO 04-06; AS PER LOCAL GOVERNMENT) **AUTH** STP -172B (034) UR COMMISSION ACTION DATE:						
22834(04)	8	US075	6.750	0	180,000	0	0	180,000
TULSA		SIGNING US-75: REPLACE OVERHEAD AND GROUND MTD. SIGNS , BEGIN .5 MI. S. OF MAIN ST. IN JENKS, AND EXT. N. 6.75 MI. TO THE I-244 INTERCHANGE NHG -014N (056) TR COMMISSION ACTION DATE: 10/2005						
22978(04)	8		0.000	0	27,451	0	0	27,451
TULSA		BRIDGE WATER PROOF SEAL 2006 SILANE PROJECTS, DIVISION 8 (DIVISION-WIDE) BRFY -172C (308) COMMISSION ACTION DATE:						
57 PROJECTS		GRAND-TOTALS		0	30,608,107	3,689,898	1,461,100	35,759,105

OTHER FUNDING CATEGORIES:
(A) CB & CR FUNDS COMBINED 7-1-97 BY HB2038
(B) LOCAL /CITY MATCHING FUNDS
PREPARED BY PROGRAMS DIVISION

02/15/2006
09:07:24

OKLAHOMA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
TENTATIVE MAY 2006 BID OPENING

PAGE: 1
JBPDC025
TOTAL

JOB PIECE	CD	HIGHWAY	MILES	ADV. FED	FEDERAL	STATE	OTHER	TOTAL
20232(04)	7	US277	3.180	0	2,731,750	0	0	2,731,750
CADD0		GRADE, DRAIN & SURFACE US-277: FROM JUST S. OF COMANCHE COUNTY LINE, EXTEND N. 3.18 MI. (RECONST TO SUPER 2)(DEL FR 02-06, ADD TO 05-06; UTILITIES) **AUTH** STPY -108C (083) COMMISSION ACTION DATE: 10/2002						
18849(04)	2	US070	3.400	0	5,573,960	0	0	5,573,960
CHOCTAW		GRADE, DRAIN & SURFACE US-70: BEGIN 3.0 MI EAST OF JCT SH-93 AND EXTEND EAST TO SH-147 (PARALLEL LANES) BR=18858(04) SMC=80/20 NHY -022N (068) COMMISSION ACTION DATE: 12/2000						
18858(04)*	2	US070	0.310	0	14,531,324	0	0	14,531,324
CHOCTAW		BRIDGE & APPROACHES US-70 @ KIAMICHI RIVER, 5.5 MI EAST OF HUGO RDY=18849(04) 80/20 SMC BRFY -022N (111) COMMISSION ACTION DATE: 12/2000						
19957(04)	4	COBRGE	0.200	0	200,000	0	190,000	390,000
GARFIELD		BRIDGE & APPROACHES (A) BRIDGE & APPROACHES OVER SAND CREEK, 3.0 MILES EAST AND 7.5 MILES NORTH OF JCT US-81/SH-45 IN ENID BRO -124D (039) CO COMMISSION ACTION DATE:						
11157(04)	4	COBRGE	0.208	0	61,600	0	246,400	308,000
GRANT		BRIDGE & APPROACHES (B) CO BR LOCATED 3.0 MILES NORTH OF GARFIELD C/L & 0.1 MI WEST OF SH74. BRF -027C (200) CO COMMISSION ACTION DATE:						
18868(04)*	6	US064	0.015	0	1,166,420	0	0	1,166,420
HARPER		BRIDGE & APPROACHES US-64 14.4 MILES EAST OF BEAVER COUNTY LINE, OVER BUFFALO CREEK BRFY -130B (042) 80/20 SMC COMMISSION ACTION DATE: 01/2001						
22355(04)	3	US062	0.020	0	100,000	0	0	100,000
MCCLAIN		TRAFFIC SIGNALS INSTALL TRAFFIC SIGNAL AT INTERS. OF US-62 & N.E. 10TH ST., IN BLANCHARD STPY -144B (092) TR COMMISSION ACTION DATE: 04/2005						
08919(04)	7	SH077D	0.204	0	1,475,880	0	0	1,475,880
MURRAY		BRIDGE & APPROACHES SH 77D AT HONEY CREEK, NEAR I-35, NORTH OF TURNER FALLS BRFY -050C (144) SMC 80/20 COMMISSION ACTION DATE: 08/1991						
21632(04)	4	PLAN	0.000	0	600,000	0	0	600,000
OKLAHOMA		SAFETY IMPROVEMENT OKLAHOMA CITY METRO AREA, CANADIAN, CLEVELAND, OKLAHOMA AND MCLAIN COUNTIES: ITS INTEGRATION PROJECT "AUTH" ITSY -QT20 (033) IT COMMISSION ACTION DATE: 07/2004						
21897(04)	8	US169	0.020	0	165,000	0	0	165,000
ROGERS		EROSION CONTROL US-169: CHANNEL MODIFICATION OF TRIB. OF FOUR MILE CREEK, APPROX. 0.75 MILE SOUTH OF JCT OF US-169/SH-88. (DEL FR 09-05, ADD TO 05-06; ENVIR. ISSUES) NHY -030N (050) COMMISSION ACTION DATE:						

02/15/2006
09:07:24

OKLAHOMA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
TENTATIVE MAY 2006 BID OPENING

PAGE: 2
JBPDC025

JOB PIECE	CD	HIGHWAY	MILES	ADV. FED	FEDERAL	STATE	OTHER	TOTAL
19997(04)	8	COBRGE	0.200	0	240,000	0	60,000	300,000
								(A)
WASHINGTON	COUNTY BRIDGE OVER COTTON CREEK, APPROX 2.8 MILES NORTH & 4.0 MILES EAST OF JCT US-75/SH-10;							
	BRO	-174D	(023)	CO	COMMISSION ACTION DATE:			
11 PROJECTS			GRAND-TOTALS	0	26,845,934	0	496,400	27,342,334

OTHER FUNDING CATEGORIES:
(A) CB & CR FUNDS COMBINED 7-1-97 BY HB2038
(B) COUNTY BRIDGE FUNDS (OLD PROGRAM)
PREPARED BY PROGRAMS DIVISION

02/15/2006
09:07:24

OKLAHOMA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
TENTATIVE JUNE 2006 BID OPENING

PAGE: 1
JBPDC025
TOTAL

JOB PIECE	CD	HIGHWAY	MILES	ADV. FED	FEDERAL	STATE	OTHER	TOTAL
21211(04)	6	COBRGE	0.200	0	280,000	0	70,000	350,000
BEAVER		BRIDGE & APPROACHES BR & APPR ON COUNTY ROAD (EW-18) OVER HOME CREEK APPROX. 4.5 MI SOUTH & 1.6 MI. WEST OF BEAVER.(DEL FR 01-06, ADD TO 06-06;NO BIDS RECVD) "AUTH" BRF -104C (037) CO COMMISSION ACTION DATE:						
22960(04)	2	US069	0.020	0	261,000	0	87,000	348,000
BRYAN		INTERSECTION MOD. & TRAF. SIGNALS DURANT: INTERSECTION MODIFICATION AT INTERSECTION OF US-69/75 & CHOCTAW RD., IN DURANT HSIPY -107A (106) TR COMMISSION ACTION DATE:						
01817(04)*	7	SH152	4.200	0	6,397,759	0	0	6,397,759
CADD0		GRADE, DRAIN & SURFACE SH 152: FROM 0.5 MI. W. OF SH-146 JCT., EXT. E 4.2 MI. (RECONST + SHLDRS)(NO BRIDGES) SMC 80/20 STPY -008B (308) COMMISSION ACTION DATE: 01/1988						
20259(07)	7	US062	2.300	0	3,331,310	0	0	3,331,310
CADD0		GRADE, DRAIN & SURFACE US-62: FR 6.75 MI. WEST OF GRADY C/L, EXT. E. 2.3 MI.(G,D & SRF- 20259(04)) (INC. \$1,375,641.00 IRR FNDS) **AUTH** BRFY -108B (132) COMMISSION ACTION DATE: 10/2002						
20259(08)	7	US062	0.606	0	1,265,516	0	0	1,265,516
CADD0		GRADE, DRAIN & SURFACE US-62: BEG. APPROX. 0.7 MILE EAST OF TONKAWA CR. & EXT. EAST 0.61 MILE. STPY -108B (139) SMC=80/20 COMMISSION ACTION DATE: 10/2002						
21711(04)	7	US062	0.030	0	1,500,000	0	0	1,500,000
CADD0		BRIDGE & APPROACHES US-62: BRIDGES & APPROACHES OVER HOG CR., BOX ELDER CR., & TWO UNNAMED CREEKS (NBI: 03166, 02866, 02641, 03213) BRFY -108B (122) COMMISSION ACTION DATE:						
23077(04)	4	IS040	0.020	0	0	100,000	0	100,000
CANADIAN		BRIDGE REPAIR I-40: REPAIR DAMAGE TO STRUCTURE OVER COLEMAN-CHAPEL RD SAP -109N (111) COMMISSION ACTION DATE:						
19469(04)	7	US277	0.038	0	114,901	0	0	114,901
COTTON		BRIDGE PAINTING US-277: DEEP RED CREEK OVERFLOW, 2.9 MILES NORTH OF JCT US-70 STPY -NBIP (250) SMC=80/20 COMMISSION ACTION DATE: 03/2002						
19469(05)	7	US277	0.038	0	56,591	0	0	56,591
COTTON		JOINT SEAL/REPAIR US-277: DEEP RED CREEK OVERFLOW, 2.9 MILES NORTH OF JCT US-70 STPY -117C (019) SMC=80/20 COMMISSION ACTION DATE: 03/2002						
20227(04)*	7	US081	0.600	0	6,446,930	0	0	6,446,930
GRADY		BRIDGE & APPROACHES US-81 OVER SOUTH CANADIAN RIVER NORTH OF MINCO BRFY -011N (053) SMC=80/20 COMMISSION ACTION DATE: 10/2002						

02/15/2006
09:07:24

OKLAHOMA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
TENTATIVE JUNE 2006 BID OPENING

PAGE: 2
JBPDC025

JOB PIECE	CD	HIGHWAY	MILES	ADV. FED	FEDERAL	STATE	OTHER	TOTAL
22436(04)	7	SH037	1.000	0	0	184,000	0	184,000
RESURFACE								
GRADY	SH-37: BEG. 0.6 MILE W. OF SH-92 JCT. EXT. E. TO CIMARRON AVE. IN TUTTLE (DEL FR 01-06, ADD TO 06-06; PRIORITY CHANGE)							
	MC	-126C	(103)	COMMISSION ACTION DATE:				
20265(04)*	3	US270	0.030	0	3,322,800	0	0	3,322,800
BRIDGE & APPROACHES								
HUGHES	US-270: OVER SALT CREEK, 2.2 MILES EAST OF JCT US-75 (DEL FR 03-06, ADD TO 06-06; ROW & UT ISSUES) SMC 80/20							
	BRFY	-132B	(057)	COMMISSION ACTION DATE: 10/2002				
13402(04)	3	SH102	0.216	0	1,590,212	0	0	1,590,212
BRIDGE & APPROACHES								
LINCOLN	SH 102: BRIDGE OVER THE TURNER TURNPIKE							
	BRFY	-041C	(239)	COMMISSION ACTION DATE: 08/1997				
13574(04)*	3	US062	1.040	0	7,653,400	0	0	7,653,400
GRADE, DRAINING, BRIDGE & SURFACE								
MCCCLAIN	US 62: FROM 0.15 MI WEST OF THE C/L NORTHEAST THROUGH BLANCHARD (RECONST. ADDED CAPACITY) (H-42) SMC 80/20							
	STPY	-044B	(319)	COMMISSION ACTION DATE: 09/1987				
22558(04)	2	SH032	0.020	0	175,000	0	0	175,000
INTERSECTION MOD. & TRAF. SIGNALS								
MARSHALL	SH-32: INSTALL FLASHING INTERSECTION CONTROL BEACONS AT INTER. OF SH-32 & SH-74F AND CONST. LEFT TURN LANES ON SH-32							
	STPG	-148C	(051)	TR	COMMISSION ACTION DATE: 06/2005			
22958(04)	4		0.000	0	250,000	0	0	250,000
SIGNING								
OKLAHOMA	OKLAHOMA CITY: INSTALL ADDITIONAL WARNING SIGNS AND DELINEATION ON ALL FREEWAYS IN OKC METRO AREA							
	HSIPG	-155A	(522)	TR	COMMISSION ACTION DATE:			
18887(04)*	8	SH088	3.500	0	10,757,425	0	0	10,757,425
GRADE, DRAINING, BRIDGE & SURFACE								
ROGERS	SH-88 FROM US-412, EXTEND NORTHWEST 3.5 MILES (DEL FR 10-05, ADD TO 06-06; UTILITIES ISSUES) **AUTH** SMC= 80/20							
	STPY	-166C	(071)	COMMISSION ACTION DATE: 12/2000				
22800(04)	8	SH266	0.020	0	500,000	0	0	500,000
INTERSECTION MOD. & TRAF. SIGNALS								
ROGERS	SH-266: INTERSECTION MODIFICATION AND TRAFFIC SIGNAL, AT THE PORT OF CATOOSA							
	STPY	-166C	(173)	COMMISSION ACTION DATE:				
13409(04)	7	SH053A	0.200	0	981,550	0	0	981,550
GRADE, DRAIN & SURFACE								
STEPHENS	SH 53A: BEG APPROX 1.0 MILE EAST OF JCT SH-53A/SH-53 & EXTEND NORTHEAST APPROX. 0.89 MILE ON NEW ALIGNMENT 80/20 SMC							
	BRFY	-069C	(236)	COMMISSION ACTION DATE: 08/1997				

02/15/2006
09:07:24

OKLAHOMA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
TENTATIVE JUNE 2006 BID OPENING

PAGE: 3
JBPDC025

JOB PIECE	CD	HIGHWAY	MILES	ADV. FED	FEDERAL	STATE	OTHER	TOTAL	
00005(14)	8	SH097	2.000	0	610,000	0	0	610,000	
LIGHTING									
TULSA SH 97 FROM 41ST. SOUTH NORTH TO US-64 (APPROX. 2.25 MI) (LIGHTING)									
STPY -072A (475) TR COMMISSION ACTION DATE: 06/1977									
09482(04)*	8	SH020	4.000	0	14,142,278	0	0	14,142,278	
GRADE, DRAIN & SURFACE									
TULSA SH-20 FROM US-169 IN TULSA CO. EAST 4.0 MILES TO EAST OF 209TH E AVE. (UNAWARDED 12/5/02, TO BE RE-LET 06-06; UTILITY ISSUES)SMC80/20 **AUTH*									
STPY -072B (421) COMMISSION ACTION DATE: 01/1988									
22957(04)	8	SH051	6.000	0	490,000	0	0	490,000	
GUARDRAIL									
TULSA SH-51: INSTALL GUARDRAIL, BEGIN AT I-444, AND EXT. E. 6 MI. TO I-44									
HSIPG -172A (303) TR COMMISSION ACTION DATE:									
22959(04)	8		0.000	0	240,000	0	0	240,000	
SIGNING									
TULSA: INSTALL ADDITIONAL WARNING SIGNS AND DELINEATION ON ALL FREEWAYS IN TULSE METRO AREA									
HSIPG -172N (304) TR COMMISSION ACTION DATE:									
23076(04)	8	IS244	0.020	0	0	100,000	0	100,000	
BRIDGE REPAIR									
TULSA I-244: REPAIR DAMAGE TO STRUCTURE ON GARNETT RD, OVER I-244, IN TULSA									
SAP -172N (313) COMMISSION ACTION DATE:									
24 PROJECTS				GRAND-TOTALS	0	60,366,672	384,000	157,000	60,907,672

OTHER FUNDING CATEGORIES:

(A) CB & CR FUNDS COMBINED 7-1-97 BY HB2038

(B) LOCAL /CITY MATCHING FUNDS

PREPARED BY PROGRAMS DIVISION